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.Your gateway to the world of Arabic retail. Tourism in the Arab

World Enter your dates now to find the best prices for your
arrival. Tourism in the Arab World From the majestic Pyramids

of Giza to the Mausoleum of Khufu, the Arab world offers
travellers a wide variety of attractions and unique cultural

experiences. While the Arab World comprises more than 53
countries, no more than four of which are developed countries,
it is a region with a population of almost a billion, with the most
populated country being the kingdom of Saudi Arabia, which is
home to about 14 million people. As tourism and travel in the
Middle East began to pick up, the region’s reputation began to
improve, with the development of Gulf, the rapid expansion of

tourism in emerging markets in Africa and Asia, as well as
growing interest in destinations such as Jordan, Lebanon, Syria,
Tunisia and Morocco. Increased interest in the region has also
led to a quick increase in regional tourism, which grew from $5
billion in 1995 to $33 billion in 2011. Tourism in the Arab world

is the second largest earner of foreign currency for most
countries, and it is expected to continue to expand. This growth
has been largely due to a series of factors, and the main ones
include: • The Arab world is culturally diverse, where modern
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and traditional values co-exist, and people’s interest in
travelling is increasing. This has led to the rise in demand for

travel in the region. • The quick increase in urbanisation, which
has led to increased demand for leisure travel, and growing
interest in food and culture. • The emergence of new tourist

destinations, such as Morocco, Tunisia and Jordan. • The
opening of new routes which have led to an increase in tourists
visiting the region, including the Haj and Umrah. The Arab world
has also established itself as a favoured destination for package

holidays. One of the reasons for this is the increase in travel
time, which has led to an increase in demand for cultural

tourism, and the emergence of destinations, such as the Grand
c6a93da74d
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